CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS

RFP-FH-12-13-1773

Emergency Medical Supplies

Concerns are listed in Bold Italics Red

Written Response 2 5 35 10 5 30 10 3 100
loriginal, 8
copies& 1 G.MFG Price] Total
Company City/State electronic A. General B. Customer Service Approach C. Firm Quialifications D. Personnel Qualifications E. Pricing F. Value Adds Lists Points
|Bound Tree Medical Dublin, OH 2 5 28 2 5 20 2 3 67
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Established in 1978. Approx. 160 Orders may be placed by, Internet, email, phone ofFanail. Customey City of Southfield $50K§} Don Adams, Ml Acct. Manager-27] Included-will extend]  Assistance in included +
employees.Service all locations Service Dept. has 27 staff members. Substitutestfeolete and City of Warren $50K, years (1 year with Boundtree), Rorj to MITN, will accept] writing grants if temporary
with two days except N. & S. Jdiscontinued items are agreed upon by Acct. Managércustomer. Fir] City of Sterling Hghts | Spencer, NE Regional Manager-overd8C, net 30 days. Logneeded. Bound Trq access to th{
Dakota which will take 3 They Jof the month, the purchasing team will review keyris looking for spikd$50K, Brandon Townshjyears exp. (7 years BT) Janis Wilkins on 34/53 University website]  website
accept & will adhere specificatiorf  in demand outside normal usageOOP plan is a 1-800 number $20K, Independence Cust. Serv. Rep.- 9 years. assist in researci
provided Township $40K-Budget and training tool
Totals are off (not
J[Emergency Medical Products Cudahy, W 2 5 10 0 5 20 7 3 52
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Established in 1974. They Pridg¢ Orders Phone, fax or website, Contract pricing léllon website + ordgr Livonia Fire, Grand | Brad Smith VP of Sales-23yrs, Michgdhcluded-will extend] EMP will offer an included
themselves on fast efficient servige history & lookup. 1-2 day shipping to MI depending location. Orderd Rapids Fire, Ferndale Buerger GM-12 years to MITN, Will Accept] additional 1%
30 full time employees, 40,000 sq place by 12pm ship same day after ships riescimated monthly Fire, City of Rochester Credit Card with no} discount for all
DC in WI. They accept all specs quantities should be provided 30 days prior to $tafr contract. Montcalm County EMY fee/rebate or ACH 4p business that is
Inventory managed by internal software prograirey do NOT providej & Oakland Community days. Low on 43/57 transacted thru thp
inventory management system on customer si@@OP plan contacty CollegeNo budget info website.
given. They note that they can provide expeditedritory but have
"ample" stockRequest for inventory numbers not reasonable & lyal
cut off for orders)
[Henry Schein Melville, NY 2 5 30 10 5 25 1 3 81
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes In business for 81 years with 35 yd Order web, fax or phone. E-Commerce site provicémneive detail & | Clinton County $40K, Steve Ray Sales Mgr. 15yrs formef Included-will extend} Free shipping & included
of EMS. US DC's combined over [Eontract pricing. . Paper or electronic invoicisgvailable. Over 200,0qMidland $15K, Northvillg Paramedic, Scott Bruner Mgr. CustorfierMITN, Will Accept] Inventory
Million Sqg. Ft of warehouse. They products offered. Transition plan includes "Matodld ananage inventory. $8K, Sterling Heights | Service 25 years, Jesse Garringer VR 3redit Card with no Management
accept all specifications Stock also includes "value priced" & "private ldbgtoducts. Video | $2K, Thunder Bay $62fyrs. & Glenn Watts Merch Mgr. 15 ye{ fee/rebateDidn't fill Software
available on website or tour is welcomed. Fill 1iat®89%. COOP plan fqr & Warren, $7K Largeil in some pkg
agency & HS described noting plan will supplemaggreey plans.  jcontracts include Brow. quantities. Low on
Website a little challenging to sort through County $286K & 87/24.
Philadelphia $578K
Montgomery,
Interboro Packaging NY 1 0 5 0 3 0 0 3 12
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS No electronic] Minority business in business for §780,000 sqg. ft. facility in Montgomery, NY. Would &g in stock annuall Wayne County Sheriff ]} Pinches Glauber Peter Guman & RiV] Included -will extend N/A included
copy years. They are submitting for glojesieeds for immediate deliverylinimum $400 order for Free delivery. Indian Lake School multiple years experience. to MITN-will accept
& Infectious waste bags only. | Ships by common carrier and can ship overnight (Wayrefer loading District, Warren credit cards or ACH
Included samples of bag & gloveg. dock delivery, however those charges are NOT inelddn the price. | Consolidated Schools 45 days. Low on 0/8
Understand & accept specificatiopSamples of products will be approved and once spepproved -if thafCity of Sterling Heights
with exceptions listed benchmark is NOT met Interboro will take the prodtisack. Muskegon CountyNo
Budget Info
J & B Medical Supply Wixom, Ml 2 5 34 10 5 23 9 3 91
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Established 1994. Sells over $] Orders can be place by Phone, Fax or via the veelf3itline "iStore" cap Dearborn Fire $30K, | James Waak, EMS Sales Managerfiiicluded -will extend MI based company, included
million products to U.S. and 27 Jcreate dozens of detailed reports through "Dasldb@aporting Tool. C Detroit EMS $100K, | years, Jeff Beutner Ml EMS Territory to MITN-will accept] American product
countries. Invested $3 million inj create budget amounts and trace expenditures.r$lzder be paid "net J0 Lansing Fire $50K, Manager 2 years, Don Bertucci EM$ credit cards or ACHJ noted in catalog,
state of the art computer systen] day" via credit card without fees. Orders placefbiee2 are guarantee Oxford Fire $27K, Training and Customer Support parf- Did not break down} Continuation of th
upgrade. Understand & accepf next day delivery. Will stock core items and namecitems purchased §n  Warren Fire $31. time 5 years. Ray Shepard, Genergl component price or§ EMS Education
specifications with exceptions listqch regular basis. If items become obsolete or utablaj J&B's EMS teal Manager 11 years. Chris Responddlseveral items. Low gh Fund, training on
will find comparable items as replacements. Comgmslve COOP pla Customer Service Manager 10 yea 52/13 any product.
included




CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS

RFP-FH-12-13-1773
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Company City/State electronic A. General B. Customer Service Approach C. Firm Quialifications D. Personnel Qualifications E. Pricing F. Value Adds Lists Points
IMed-Part Brooklyn, NY 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 3
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Did not include any additional Did not include. Did not include. Did not include. Included pricing for § Did not include. Did not
Disqualified- did not completp information. Only information handful of items. include.
the required information provided was on the pricing form They will extend to Included
MITN- will accept website
credit card or ACH 4] address.
days. Low on 1/0
IMidwest Medical Earth City, Md
2 5 27 0 5 20 1 3 63
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Established in 1970. 380 full & pgytOrders can be place by Phone, Fax or via the weedMS has a Quic City of Roseville, Jennifer Roles-Office Mgr. 9 yrs., Jujdncluded-will extend] Free Inventory Mg]  Catalog
time employees. The servicing] Order format that is accessed on line for regulecipases. They accefjtBeaumont Grosse Poing@®nest & JoAnn Rudd Customer Services MITN-will accept Program included
warehouse is located in St. Louig. EDI orders too. Order placed by 4pm will ship satag by Fed Ex 2day Sterling Height FD, City 37 Yrs. combined.. credit cards with ng
They accept & will adhere or common carriefT hey stock 98% of Core items to make transitiofof Rochester Hills & Mo fee, check & ACH.
specifications "smooth”. MMS does not take back anything purchased that hag Community CollegeNo Low on 34/45
become obsoleteComprehensive COOP plan included. Budget Info
IMoore Medical Farmington, Cf
2 1 24 7 4 17 1 3 59
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Subsidiary of McKesson Surgice§- Customer Service M-F 8-5 EST. Committed to "oné-cabolution of | Lake Michigan Colleggl Nancy Vitulano Contract Admin-11ymsincluded -will extenq Comprehensive | web access
open since 1947. They have 45 issues. Orders web, email, fax or mail. Will stitekns in 3 DC's CT, FR $40K, Macomb Countyy Sharon Husenita-Cust Service 5yrs Rto MITN-will accept | Web Tools & AED] with temp
employees at 7 locations nationwi[ or CA. Inventory levels are maintained by mainfresystem. Can add] Community College | Lisa Hunt Contract Compliance 15 ygscredit cards, checkd, = Compliance password
They accept all specs- took excep approver levels to website orderifighey do not presently have a $13K, Oceana EMS ACH 45 days. Low o] Management included
to parts of Insurance requiremery. transition plan, but included a comprehensive COOP pglame items | $11K, City of Riverview 26/20.
on the core list will take longer than 48 hrs. falelivery. $11K Washtenaw Publg
Health $10K
Quad Med Jacksonville, H- 2 3 5 0 0 10 0 3 23
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes Full-line Distributor founded in 199 Same day order entry & fulfillment until 3pm ESTid@rs via phone, JCity of Jacksonville, La Marley Price VP & Mindy Langorgel§ Included but did nof N/A Catalog
- 15 employees on stage with onge email, fax or internet. Warehouse stocks @&/€00 itemson a regular JEMS, Orange County Fif  Inside Sales - No experience listeq fill out form as included
warehouse in Jacksonville, FL. | basis. Contract pricing will be loaded on the web.official COOP plar} & Rescue, City of Tampp requested which ma
Acknowledge and will adhere to] "will make arrangements for shipping in the evenf an emergency." | & Desoto Fire & Rescug- it difficult to tabulate
specifications No Budget Info Low on 17/33
Sunshine Medical Livonia, Ml 2 2 5 5 1 6 0 3 24
NOTES & EXCEPTIONS Yes 17 years in business. Five Full-tine  Accept orders via phone, fax & internet. Michigamsiess "When | Clinton Twp. Fire $7K,] Kathy Garrity Sales Rep worked sinpéncluded-Will Extend  Provide lowest included
problems occur they are addressed and resolvellgtiithey Midland Fire $3K, Novi 1977 Accepts credit card ¢ prices and review

& 3 part-time employees. Starte:

supplying gloves & expanded
business. Lots of Dental Supplies
web. They accept all specificationg
written..

"maintain sufficient stock" COOP plan -hand deliver of supplies with
on phone number of contact person.

Police, $2.5K, Rosevill
Fire $8K & Ypsilanti Fir
$4K.

check. No low.

new products to
ensure best valug




CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
RFP-FH-12-13-1773 FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES PRICES LISTED ARE THE COMPONENT PRICE
Emergency Medical Supplies
Core Item Tabulation
BOUND TREE HENRY INTERBORO MIDWEST MOORE SUNSHINE
LN # CATEGORY MANF. DESCRIPTION PART# MEDICAL EMP SCHEIN PACKAGING J &B MEDICAL MED-PART MEDICAL MEDICAL QUADMED MEDICAL LOW
1 [Airway Maintenance AMBU ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE HOLDER W(HT |AMB320-264-041 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.31po AS SPECIFIED $2.83000 AS SPEOIF$ 2.650! NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 2.7200 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 3.180d0 AS SPECIFIED $ 2.84000 NO+BID NO+BID 2.6500(
VELCRO STRAP
2 |Alternate for Above LAERDAL 020500 $ 2.8000 LAERDAL 04500 $2.6500( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID EAW2338 $ 3.330 NO-BIC 2.6500(
3 |Airway Maintenance AMSINO | AMSINO AMSURE SUCTION CATHTERS |JAMSAS361C NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.2500 NO-BID AS SPECIBE $ 0.280] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.23000 SRECIFIED $ 0.1900¢ NO-BID NO-BID 0.19009
6FR Coiled Graduated Suction Catheter, 50fcs
4 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 533- $ 0.20do MEDSOURCE $0.1900§ MEDSOURCE $ 0.190 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID DYNAREX| $ 0.1700) NO-BID EAW2201 $ 0.214qo NO-BID 0.17004
MS-SCO6EA 40106 MSSCO06 DYN4806
5 |Airway Maintenance AMSINO | AMSINO AMSURE SUCTION CATHTERS |JAMSAS363C NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.2500 NO-BID AS SPECIBE $ 0.280] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.23000 SRECIFIED $ 0.1900¢ NO-BID NO-BID 0.19004
10FR Coiled Graduated Suction Catheter, 5¢/cs
6 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 533- $ 0.20do MEDSOURCE $0.1900§ MEDSOURCE $ 0.190 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID DYNAREX| $ 0.1700) NO-BID EAW2203 $ 0.214qo NO-BID 0.17004
MS-SC10EA 40110 MSSC10 DYN4810
7 |Airway Maintenance AMSINO | AMSINO AMSURE SUCTION CATHTERS |AMSAS365C NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.27¢00 NO-BID AS SPECIBE $ 0.280] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.23000 SRECIFIED $ 0.1900¢ NO-BID NO-BID 0.19004
14FR Coiled Suction Catheter, 50/cs
8 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 533- $ 0.20do MEDSOURCE $0.19000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.190 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID EAW2205 $ @10d NO-BID 0.19009
MS-SC14EA 40102 MS-SC14
9 |Airway Maintenance AMSINO | AMSINO AMSURE SUCTION YANKUER |AMSAS833 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.59¢00 NOHB AS SPECIFIED $ 0.5500 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.5500(
Rigid Suction Yankauer w/ bulb tip, Vented,
Sterile, 50/cs
10 |Alternate for Above RMS MEDICAL| $ 13.21do MEDSTOR] $0.34000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.460] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 0.570) NO-BID DYNAREX| $ 0.360q0 BUSSE 303 $ 2.7¢000 EAW2209 $ .3700 O-BIN 0.34009
6240 16107 MS-YK10 YK10 DYN4690
11 |Airway Maintenance BEMIS BEMIS HYDROPHOBIC SUCTION BEM424410 AS SPECIFIED $ 2.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $2.27000 AS SPEOIF$ 2.100 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 2.3800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 2.200do AS SPECIFIED $ 2.34000 AS $ 2.590p NO-BID 2.10004
CANISTER SYSTEM Suction Canister, 800¢c, SPECIFIED
12 |Alternate for Above BEMIS 2212-25507 $ 2.310 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 2.31004
13 | Airway Maintenance BEMIS BEMIS HI-FLOW SUCTION CANTER BEM484410 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.63p0 AS SPECIFIED $2.79000 AS SPEOIF $ 2.810] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.1p00 NO-BID S 8PECIFIED $ 2.6900) AS SPECIFIED $ 2.790p0 AS $ 2.790p NO-BID 2.6900(
SYSTEM Suction Canister, 1200cc, 48/cs SPECIFIED
14 |Alternate for Above BEMIS 049-AV-| $ 2.110| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 2.11004
1200-4EA
15 |Airway Maintenance CONMED| CONMED CORPORATION SUCNO CMDO0034290 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.93p0 AS SPECIFIED $1.53000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.710 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.9600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.93040 NO-BID AS $ 0.730p NO-BID 0.71009
TUBING 1/4"1.D. X 6° MALE CONNECTOR] SPECIFIED
16 |Alternate for Above AMSINO 16008 $ 0.70p0 MEDSOURCE $0.6500( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID AMSINO| $ 0.7704o0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6500(4
50245 AMSAS825|
17 | Airway Maintenance COVIDIEN|COVIDIEN ARGYLE CONNECTING TUBEYCOV8888301606 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.92p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.84000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.780 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.780 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.83doo AS SPECIFIED 0.8018p NO-BID NO-BID 0.7800(
Connecting Tube, %" x 6', Molded Ends, 50/fs
18 |Alternate for Above AMSINO 16008 $ 0.700| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 0.70004
19 |Airway Maintenance KING KING AIRWAY SET SZ 3 INCLDS KNGKLTSD403SET AS SPECIFIED $ 34.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $34.7¢000 NO-BID ND-BI AS SPECIFIED $ 35.50¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 35.6000 NO-BI AS| $  30.450 NO-BID 30.4500(4
SYSTEMS |SYRINGE/LUBE PACK SPECIFIED
20 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID INTASURGICAL| $ 21.4000p NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 21.40004
1S1870303(
21 |Airway Maintenance KING KING AIRWAY SET SZ 4 INCLDS KNGKLTSD404SET AS SPECIFIED $ 34.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $34.7¢000 NO-BID ND-BI AS SPECIFIED $ 35.50¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 35.6000 NO-BI AS| $  30.450 NO-BID 30.4500(4
SYSTEMS |SYRINGE/LUBE PACK SPECIFIED
22 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID INTASURGICAL| $ 21.4000p NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 21.40004
1S1870403(
23 | Airway Maintenance KING KING AIRWAY SET SZ 5 INCLDS KNGKLTSD405SET AS SPECIFIED $ 34.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $34.7¢000 NO-BID ND-BI AS SPECIFIED $ 35.50¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 35.6000 NO-BI AS| $  30.450 NO-BID 30.4500(4
SYSTEMS |SYRINGE/LUBE PACK SPECIFIED
24 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID INTASURGICAL| $ 21.4000p NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 21.40004
1S1870503(
25 |Airway Maintenance MALLLINCKICOMBITUBE 41FR AIRWAY TRAINER MAL5-18141 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $60.750Q0 AS SPECIFIELS  55.380 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 75.34¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 60.7500D AS SPECIFIED $  58.02D00 AS $ 60.400p NO-BID 55.3800(
RODT, INC. |DOUBLE-LUMEN 1/CASE SPECIFIED
26 |Alternate for Above KENDALL 0218141 $ 60.760| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 60.76004
27 |Airway Maintenance MALLLINCKICOMBITUBE 41FR AIRWAY ROLL-UP MAL5-18441 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $42.410Q0 AS SPECIFIELS  38.650 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 55.68¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $  41.9000D AS SPECIFIED $  40.50D00 AS $ 42.160p NO-BID 38.6500(4
RODT, INC. |PACK DOUBLE-LUMEN SPECIFIED
28 |Alternate for Above KENDALL 0218441 $ 39.950 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 39.9500(4
29 |Airway Maintenance MALLLINCKICOMBITUBE 37FR AIRWAY TRAY PACK |MAL5-18537 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $42.410Q0 AS SPECIFIED $ 46.4100 NO-BID AEGFIED| $ 55.6800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 50.7$000 AS SPECIFIED $  49.050p0 AS| $  42.160 NO-BID 42.16004
RODT, INC. |DOUBLE-LUMEN SPECIFIED
30 |Alternate for Above KENDALL 0218537 $ 51.360 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| AS SPECIED NO-BID NO-BID 51.36004
31 |Airway Maintenance REPRO-MEJRES-Q-VAC SOFT W/CATHETERS & RMSP1N1S110S AS SPECIFIED $ 66.18p0 AS SPECIFIED $66.0$000 NO-BID ND-BI AS SPECIFIED $ 65.83¢0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID AS| $  61.920 NO-BID 61.92004
SYSTEMS |SEALING CAP SPECIFIED
32 |Alternate for Above REPRO-MEL $ 14.550 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID AMB276-000-001 $ 48.2400 RMS P1F1 $ 51.42900 NO-BID NO-BID 14.5500(
590761
33 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ORAL AIRWAY ORANGE 110MM X& SUN1-1506-11 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.28p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.24000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.140 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.1600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.18040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.14004
ADULT SZ 6 BERMAN
34 |Alternate for Above ASIA| $ 0.13do MEDSTORM $0.11004 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| TECH MED, $ 0.23000 EAW241001 $ 0.1p00 NO-BID 0.11009
CONNECTION 12981MS 8401#111
35 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ORAL AIRWAY PINK 40MM NEWBRN SZ|SUN1-1506-40 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.27p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.24000 AS SPEOIF $ 0.240] NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 0.160 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.18doo NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.16009
00 BERMAN
36 |Alternate for Above MEDSTORM 12974 $ 0.13p0 MEDSTORM $0.07004 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| TECH MED $ 0.23000 EAW240001 $ 0.1p00 NO-BID 0.07009
12974MS 8401#4
37 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ORAL AIRWAY BLACK 60MM SMKEILD |SUN1-1506-60 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.27p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.24000 AS SPEOIF $ 0.240] NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 0.160 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.18doo NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.16004
SZ 1 BERMAN TYPE
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CITY OF FARMINGTON HILLS
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Core Item Tabulation
BOUND TREE HENRY INTERBORO MIDWEST MOORE SUNSHINE
LN # CATEGORY MANF. DESCRIPTION PART# MEDICAL EMP SCHEIN PACKAGING J &B MEDICAL MED-PART MEDICAL MEDICAL QUADMED MEDICAL LOW
38 |Alternate for Above MEDSTORM 1297 0.13p0 MEDSTORM $0.07004 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| TECH MED 840] $ 0.23000 EAW240201 $ 0.1p00 NO-BID 0.07009
12976MS #60
39 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ORAL AIRWAY GREEN 80MM SMAL SUN1-1506-80 AS SPECIFIED 0.27p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.24000 AS SPEOIF $ 0.240] NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 0.160 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.18doo NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.16004
ADULT SZ 3 BERMAN
40 [Alternate for Above MEDSTORM 1297: 0.13p0 MEDSTORM $0.07004 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| TECH MED 840] $ 0.23000 EAW240301 $ 0.1p00 NO-BID 0.07009
12978MS #60
41 [Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ORAL AIRWAY YELLOW 90MM MED SUN1-1506-90 AS SPECIFIED 0.27p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.24000 AS SPEOIF $ 0.240] NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 0.160 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.18doo NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.16004
ADULT SZ 4 BERMAN TYP
42 [Alternate for Above ASIA 0.13do MEDSTORM $0.07004 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| TECH MED 840] $ 0.23000 EAW240401 $ 0.1p00 NO-BID 0.07004
CONNECTION 12979MS #90
43 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED|ORAL AIRWAY RED 100MM LG ADULT SZSUN1-1506-99 AS SPECIFIED 0.27p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.24000 AS SPEOIF $ 0.240] NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 0.160 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.18doo NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.16009
5 BERMAN TYPE
44 | Alternate for Above ASIA 0.13do MEDSTORM $0.07004 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| TECH MED 840] $ 0.23000 EAW240501 $ 0.1p00 NO-BID 0.0700d
CONNECTION129 12980MS #100
45 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 2.5MM 10FR SUN1-7330-25 AS SPECIFIED 0.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.6600( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.93¢00 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.68040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6600(4
MURPHY UN-CUFFED
46 [Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211 0.62d0 MEDSTOR] $0.33000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.840 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM{ $ 0.900] NO-BID NO-BID RUSCH 100382025 1.1y000 EAW230001 $0.840f NO-BID 0.33004
20325 36151 MS-23125 23125
47 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 3.0MM 12FR SUN1-7330-30 AS SPECIFIED 0.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.6600( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 0.9390 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.68040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6600(4
MURPHY UN-CUFFED
48 [Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211 0.62d0 MEDSTOR] $0.33000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.840 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 0.900] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.56040 RUSCH 100382030 1.1f000 EAW230101 $ 0.7400 O-BID\ 0.3300(9
20330 36152 MS-23130 23130 100/101/03(
49 [Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 3.5MM 14FR SUN1-7330-35 AS SPECIFIED 0.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.6600( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 0.93¢00 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.68040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6600(4
MURPHY UN-CUFFED
50 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211 0.62d0 MEDSTOR] $0.33000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.840 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 0.900] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.56040 RUSCH 100382035 1.1f000 EAW230201 $ 0.7400 O-BID\ 0.3300(9
20335 36153 MS-23135 23135 100/101/03!
51 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 4.5MM 18FR SUN1-7330-45 AS SPECIFIED 0.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.66000 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.79 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 0.9300 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.68d00 NO-BID NO-BID NEDD 0.66004
MURPHY UN-CUFFED
52 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211 0.62d0 MEDSTOR] $0.33000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.840 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM{ $ 0.900] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.56040 RUSCH 100382045 1.1f000 EAW230401 $ 0.7400 O-BID\ 0.33009
20345 36155 MS-23145 23145 100/101/04!
53 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 5.0MM 20FR SUN1-7330-50 AS SPECIFIED 0.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.66000 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.79 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 0.9300 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.68000 NO-BID NO-BID NEDD 0.6600(4
MURPHY UN-CUFFED
54 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211 0.62d0 MEDSTOR] $0.33000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.840 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 0.900] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.56040 RUSCH 100382050 1.1f000 EAW230501 $ 0.7400 O-BID\ 0.3300(9
20350 36156 MS-23150 23150 100/101/05(
55 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 5.5MM 22FR SUN1-7330-55 AS SPECIFIED 0.72p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.6600( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 0.9390 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.68040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.66004
MURPHY UN-CUFFED
56 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211 0.62d0 MEDSTOR] $0.33000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.840 NO-BID MEDSOURCE-MSOMY{ $ 0.900] NO-BID SMITHS POF  $ 0.56040 RUSCH 100382055 1.1f000 EAW230601 $ 0.7400 O-BID\ 0.33009
20355 36157 MS-23155 23155 100/101/05!
57 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 10.0MM 40FR |SUN1-7333-10 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(4
MURPHY CUFFED
58 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID NO-BID RUSCH 112082100 1.24000 EAW232001 $0.920f NO-BID 0.5400(9
13387 36168 MS-23210 23210
59 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 5.0MM 20FR SUN1-7333-50 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.93009
MURPHY CUFFED
60 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSOURCE $1.0000§ MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.7900p RUSCH 112082050 1.24Q00 EAW231001 $ 0§9200 NO-BID 0.79009
13378 11150 MS-23250 23250 100/100/05(
61 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 5.5MM 22FR SUN1-7333-55 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(9
MURPHY CUFFED
62 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082055 1.2000 EAW231101 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13379 36159 MS-23255 23255 100/100/05!
63 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 6.0MM 24FR SUN1-7333-60 AS SPECIFIED 1.04p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(9
MURPHY CUFFED
64 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082060 1.2000 EAW231201 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13380 36160 MS-23260 23260 100/100/06(
65 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 6.5MM 24FR SUN1-7333-65 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(4
MURPHY CUFFED
66 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082065 1.2j000 EAW231301 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13381 36161 MS-23265 23265 100/100/06!
67 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 7.0MM 28FR SUN1-7333-70 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.00¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.93009
MURPH CUFFED
68 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082070 1.2000 EAW231401 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13382 36162 MS-23270 MDSOURS-2327 100/100/07(
69 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 7.5MM 30FR SUN1-7333-75 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(4
MURPHY CUFFED
70 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF  $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082075 1.2000 EAW231501 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13383 36163 MS-23275 23275 100/100/07!
71 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 8.0MM 32FR SUN1-7333-80 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.93009
MURPHY CUFFED
72 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082080 1.2000 EAW231601 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13384 36164 MS-23280 23280 100/100/08(
73 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 8.5MM 34FR SUN1-7333-85 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.93009
MURPHY CUFFED
74 | Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF  $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082085 1.2000 EAW231701 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13385 36165 MS-23285 23285 100/100/08!
75 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 9.0MM 36FR SUN1-7333-90 AS SPECIFIED 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.11¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(4
MURPHY CUFFED
76 |Alternate for Above SMITHS MEDICAL 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000 MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.000] NO-BID SMITHS POF $ 0.79040 RUSCH 112082090 1.2000 EAW231801 $ 0.9200 O-BID\ 0.5400(9
13386 36166 MS-23290 23290 100/100/09(
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77 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE 9.5MM 38FR SUN1-7333-95 AS SPECIFIED $ 1.01po AS SPECIFIED $0.9300( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.10¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.96040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.9300(9
MURPHY CUFFED
78 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 211/ $ 0.85d0 MEDSTOR] $0.54000] MEDSOURCE $ 0.900] NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM{ $ 1.000] NO-BID NO-BID RUSCH 112082095 $ 1.24000 EAW231901 $1.150f NO-BID 0.5400(9
20295 36167 MS-23295 23295
79 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 1 SUN5-5332-01 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400 AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
INFANT MACINTOSH SPECIFIED
80 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NOBID NO-BID NO-BID 0.0000d
81 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 2 SUN5-5332-02 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400 AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
CHILD MACINTOSH SPECIFIED
82 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46212
83 | Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 3 MD |SUN5-5332-03 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400| AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
ADLT MACINTOSH SPECIFIED
84 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46213
85 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE SBZE 4 LG |SUN5-5332-04 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400 AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
ADULT MACINTOSH SPECIFIED
86 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46214
87 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 0 SUN5-5333-00 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400 AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
NEWBORN MILLER SPECIFIED
88 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE-MSOMY{ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46220
89 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 1 SUN5-5333-01 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400 AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
INFANT MILLER SPECIFIED
90 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46221
91 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 2 SUN5-5333-02 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400| AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
CHILD MILLER SPECIFIED
92 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46222
93 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| GREENLINE/D F/O BLADE S&ZE 3 SUN5-5333-03 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.26000 AS SPECIFIED $ 3.701 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.4600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.95700 AS SPECIFIED $ 4.6400| AS $ 4.090p NO-BID 3.2600(
MED. ADULT MILLER SPECIFIED
94 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
46223
95 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| STYLET 6FR ALUMINUM SUN9-0204-11 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $0.9100( NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.21¢0 NO-BID AS SPE@ED| $ 0.92040 NO-BID AS $ 1.930p NO-BID 0.91009
ENDOTRACHEAL 2-6MM PEDIAT SPECIFIED
96 |Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 533- $ 1.8500 NO-BID MEDSOURCE $ 1.360 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 1.3600(
MS-ETS100EA MS ETS10
97 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| STYLET 9FR ALUMINUM L/F SUN9-0204-25 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.910) AS SPECIFIED $0.9100q AS SPECIFIED $ 1.01 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.32100 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.92doo NO-BID NO-BID NEDD 0.91009
ENDOTRACHEAL 6-11MM ADULT
98 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE $ 1.360! NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 1.3600(
MS ETS20
99 |Airway Maintenance SUN MED| STYLET 8FR SUNGLIDE ENDOARHEAL |SUN9-0209-72 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $2.71040 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 2.940 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 2.6000) NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 2.6000(
4 - 7TMM
100 |Alternate for Above EMERGENCY $ 2.840 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 2.8400(
MED PROD 503108
101 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH LITE KIT W/DISPOSABLE BLADE$ TEL0048 AS SPECIFIED $ 64.26p0 AS SPECIFIED $64.28000 AS SPEDIFIE  77.690) NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 77.0p00 NO-BID AS SFEED| $ 0.7400 AS SPECIFIED $  64.460p0 AS $ 90.950p NO-BID 0.74009
MEDICAL SPECIFIED
102 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NOBID NO-BID NO-BID 0.0000d
103 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJQUICKTRACH EMERGENCY KIT ADULT |TEL120900040 AS SPECIFIED $ 129.76p0 AS SPECIFIED  $124.7$000 AS SPECI|FID139.840 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 133.2%00 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.3100 AS SPECIFIED $ 131.360p0 AS| $ 145.030p NO-BID 1.31004
MEDICAL |4.0MM SPECIFIED
104 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NOBID NO-BID NO-BID 0.0000d
105 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123020 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.21 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(9
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 20F Amber
106 |Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.04q0 MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1- $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢0 NO-BID EAW242001 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51154MS 5076-20 SUN150762(
107 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123022 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.21 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(4
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 22F Amber
108 | Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1- $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.56040 NO-BID EAW242201 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51155MS 5076-22 SUN150762]
109 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123024 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.21 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(4
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 24F Amber
110 |Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1- $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢o NO-BID EAW242401 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51156MS 5076-24 SUN150762¢
111 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123026 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.21 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(9
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 26F Amber
112 | Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1- $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢0 NO-BID EAW242601 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51157MS 5076-26 SUN150762(
113 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123028 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.21 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(9
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 28F Amber
114 | Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1- $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢0 NO-BID EAW242801 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51158MS 5076-28 SUN150762¢
115 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXJRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123030 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.21 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(9
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 30F Amber
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116 |Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1: $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢0 NO-BID EAW243001 $ 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51159MS 5076-30 SUN150763(
117 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXIRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123032 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.2100 NO-BID AS SPECIBE$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(4
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 32F Amber
118 | Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1: $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢0 NO-BID EAW243201 $ 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51160MS 5076-32 SUN150763]
119 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXIRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123034 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.2100 NO-BID AS SPECIBES$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(4
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 34F Amber
120 |Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1: $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢0 NO-BID EAW243401 $ 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51161MS 5076-34 SUN150763¢
121 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXIRUSCH ROBERTAZZI MEDIPRENE TEL123036 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.2100 NO-BID AS SPECIBE$ 0.960 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 5.28d00 NO-BID NO-BID OMNBID 0.9600(4
MEDICAL |NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY 36F Amber
122 | Alternate for Above CURAPLEX $ 2.044qo MEDSTORM $1.02000 SUNMED1: $ 1.650] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID SUNMED $ 1.560¢o NO-BID EAW243601 $ 1.4900 NO-BID 1.02004
51162MS 5076-36 SUN150763(
123 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEXISTYLETTE 12FR. FLEXI-SLIP STERILE TEL502505 AS SPECIFIED $ 1.780 AS SPECIFIED $1.78000 AS SPECIFIED $ 2.0600 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 2.1800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.87Q00 NO-BID AS $ 2.430p NO-BID 1.7800(
MEDICAL SPECIFIED
124 | Alternate for Above NO-BID MEDSOURCE $1.6800§ MEDSOURCE $ 1.360 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 1.3600(
103003 MS ET630!
125 | Airway Maintenance TELEFLEX]STYLETTE 14FR FLEXI-SLIP STERILE L/H TEL502507 AS SPECIFIED $ 1.770] AS SPECIFIED $2.330q0 AS SPECIFIED $ 2.0600 NO-BID AS SPEDIF $ 2.180] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.84000 NO-BID AS $ 1.930p NO-BID 1.77004
MEDICAL SPECIFIED
126 |Alternate for Above NO-BID MEDSOURCE $1.6800§ MEDSOURCE $ 1.360 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 1.3600(
103004 MS ET400
127 |Breathing / Respiratory ALLIED |ALLIED OXYGEN MASKS Pediatric Mask |ALL64009 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $1.4904o NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.490( NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 1.56p00 AS SPEEDFI$ 1.20000 AS $ 0.750 NO-BID 0.7500(4
HEALTHCAR |Medium-High Concentration w/o Check Valv| SPECIFIED
128 | Alternate for Above CAREFUSION $ 1.09d0 CAREFUSION $0.9800§ MEDSOURCE $ 0.680 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢{ $ 1.100] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6800(
411268 001267 MS-26042 25073
129 |Breathing / Respiratory ALLIED |ALLIED B & F HUMIDIFIER w/ plastic nut, 3|ALL64375 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $1.27040 AS SPECIFIED $ 1.2400 NO-BID SRECIFIED $ 1.5140 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 1.1400 NO-BID AS $ 1.430p NO-BID 1.14004
HEALTHCAR |PSI Pressure Relief, 50/cs SPECIFIED
130 |Alternate for Above TRI-ANIM | $ 1.240| NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NO-BID NOBID NO-BID 1.24004
131 |Breathing / Respiratory AMBU RES-CUE MASK BASIC RED RB CASE | AMB000-252-103 AS SPECIFIED $ 5.48p0 AS SPECIFIED $3.7Q000 AS SPEOIF$ 3.390 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 4.5000 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 5.75040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 3.3900(
132 | Alternate for Above NO-BID MEDSTORM $2.31000 MEDSOURCE $ 3.760] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID LIFESYSTEMS $ 2.69040 NO-BID EAW2759 $ 2.7p00 NO-BID 2.31004
36045 MS-PM104 LFS005¢
133 | Breathing / Respiratory AMBU AMBU SPUR Il DISPOSABLE AMB520-211-000 AS SPECIFIED $ 10.50p0 AS SPECIFIED $9.2Q000 AS SPEOIFEE  8.750 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 9.3300 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 11.500d0 AS SPECIFIED 9.54000 NO+BID NO+BID 8.7500(
RESUSCITATOR Adult Bag with Adult Masl|
134 | Alternate for Above NO-BID CURAPLEX 301 $7.3200 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID LIFESYSTEMS $ 7.1000) NO-BID EAW271002 $ 8.4900 NO-BID 7.10004
C1500 LFS1604
135 | Breathing / Respiratory AMBU ADULT SPUR Il FACEMASK EBA AMB520-611-700 AS SPECIFIED $ 21.23p0 AS SPECIFIED $18.81000 AS SPEDIFEE 17.280 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $  20.43¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 22.5000p NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 17.2800(
RESERVOIR CO2 DETECT
136 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 22.500q0 NO-BID EAW2713105 14.3301 NO-BID 14.3300(
VENSC9001E
137 |Breathing / Respiratory AMBU AMBU SPUR Il DISPOSABLE AMB530-213-000 AS SPECIFIED $ 13.63p0 AS SPECIFIED $11.93000 AS SPEDIFIE 11.600] NO-BID AS SPECIFIEDS 9.330 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 14.50400 AS SPECIFIED $12.6800 NO-BI NO-BI 9.3300(
RESUSCITATOR Pediatric Bag with Toddle
138 | Alternate for Above ASIA| $ 0.920p CURAPLEX 301. $6.0700( NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID LIFESYSTEMS $ 7.500q0 NO-BID EAW271202 $ 8.8900 NO-BID 0.92004
CONNECTION C300 LFS500Z
139 |Breathing / Respiratory AMBU AMBU SPUR Il DISPOSABLE AMB530-213-800 AS SPECIFIED $ 18.200 AS SPECIFIED $31.850¢0 MO NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $  20.4300 NO:BID AS SPECIFIED $ 25.90000 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 18.2000(
RESUSCITATOR Pediatric Bag with Toddle
140 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 12.50040 NO-BID EAW2714025 9.150 NO-BID 9.1500(
VENSCB8001E
141 |Breathing / Respiratory AMSINO| AMSINO INTERNATIONALNIC OXYGEN |AMSAS74030 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.680 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.7800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.910q40 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6800(
MASK PEDIATRIC MEDIUM CONCEN W/7
142 | Alternate for Above VENTLAB 87-2200 $ 0.51¢0 CAREFUSION $0.7500 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.5000 ALLIED| $ 0.7200p EAW2009 $ 0.7%00 NO-BID 0.5000(9
001262 VEN2200 HEALTHCARE
64092
143 | Breathing / Respiratory PRECISIO]fOXYGEN FLOWMETER 0-15 LPM PCS8MFA1005 AS SPECIFIED $ 29.400 AS SPECIFIED $31.730¢Q0 AS SPECIFIE $ 29.4400 NO-BID AS SPECIFIE  29.700) NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 33.9¢Joo0o NO-:BID AS $ 31.170p NO-BID 29.40004
MEDICAL |W/OHMEDA CONNECTOR SPECIFIED
144 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID| NOBID NO-BID NO-BID 0.0000d
145 | Breathing / Respiratory TELEFLEJOXYGEN MASK PEDIATRIC HIGH TEL1000 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $2.15040 AS SPECIFIED 1.1501 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 2.2300 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 2.100do NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 1.15004
MEDICAL |CONCENTRATION W/BAG
146 | Alternate for Above MEDSOURCE 533- $ 1.49do NO-BID ALLIED 9115-$% 1.170] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID ALLIED| $ 1.2000p EAW2004$ 0.910 NO-BID 0.91009
MS-25058EA 0008 HEALTHCARE
6400¢
147 |Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE CONCENTRATION MASR&diatric MSOMS-26042 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.85p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.84000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.680 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.15¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.850q0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6800(4
Medium Concentration Mask, 50/cs
148 | Alternate for Above VENTLAB 87-2200 $ 0.510 CAREFUSION $0.7500 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.5000 ALLIED| $ 0.7200D EAW2006 $ 0.7$00 NO-BID 0.5000(9
001262 VEN2200 HEALTHCARE
6400;
149 | Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE CONCENTRATION MASK&ult Elongated| MSOMS-26041 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.79p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.8J000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.690 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.0090 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.7704o NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6900(4
Medium Concentration Mask, 50/cs
150 |Alternate for Above TELEFLEX A03751 $ 0.524o MEDSTOR| $0.5200 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.4704o0 MED TECH $ 0.4600¢ EAW2005 $ 0.460 NO-BID 0.4600(4
1 30054 VEN2100 MTR25059
151 |Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE NONREBREATHING MASR&diatric MasqMSOMS-25058 AS SPECIFIED $ 1.49p0 AS SPECIFIED $1.04000 AS SPEOIF $ 1.030] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.1$00 NO-BID S 8PECIFIED $ 0.914o0 NO-BID AS| $ 0.750 NO-BID 0.7500(4
w/ safety vent & 7 ft tubing, 50/cs SPECIFIED
152 | Alternate for Above VENTLAB 87-2201 $ 0.93¢0 MEDSTORM  $0.6400( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.7104o0 ALLIED| $ 1.2300p NO-BID NO-BID 0.6400(4
30053 VEN2201 HEALTHCARE
6409(
153 | Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE ADULT MASKS W/SAFEVENT & 7' MSOMS-25059 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.95po AS SPECIFIED $0.93000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.770 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.15¢0 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.810q0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.77004
TUBING
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154 | Alternate for Above VENTLAB 2356- $ 0.640| CURAPLEX 87 $0.6700 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.680q0 ALLIED| $ 1.0100p EAW2003 $ 0.8900 NO-BID 0.6400(4
21002 2101 VEN2101| HEALTHCARE
64060
155 |Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE NONREBREATHING MASK@&ult Mask MSOMS-25060 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.92p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.93000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.760 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 1.0090 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.810q0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.76004
w/7 ft tubing & w/o safety vent, 50/cs
156 |Alternate for Above NO-BID CURAPLEX 87 $0.6700( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.69040 ALLIED| $ 1.0100p 22012 0.6B00 NO-BID 0.67004
2102 VEN2102 HEALTHCARE
64059
157 | Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE OVER-THE-EAR CANNUW.®ver-the-Ear [MSOMS-24003 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.35p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.32000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.270 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.29¢00 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.300q0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.27004
Cannula w/ curved nonflared nasal tips, 7ft.
158 | Alternate for Above VENTLAB 14645 $ 0.230) MEDSTORM $0.2500 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.29040 RUSCH 1110 0.54000 EAW2000 $ .2500 O-BIN 0.23004
30050 VEN1107,
159 |Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE OVER-THE-EAR CANNUW.®ver-the-Ear [MSOMS-24004 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.32p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.29000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.280 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.29¢00 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.300q0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.2800(
Cannula w/ curved flared nasal tips, 50/cs
160 |Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.2400) RUSCH 1104 $ 0.360p0 EAW200010 0.p500 NO-BID 0.24004
VEN1007,
161 |Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE OXYGEN TUBING 7 fagtard Oxygen MSOMS-20007 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.30po0 AS SPECIFIED $0.3J000 AS SPEOIF$ 0.260 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.29¢00 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.31040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.26004
Supply Tubing w/ standard connector, 50/cs|
162 | Alternate for Above SALTER LABS 77- $ 0.28J0 CAREFUSION $0.2700 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.2400 ALLIED| $ 0.2900p EAW203 $ 0.3%00 NO-BID 0.24004
2002EA 001302 VEN3007, HEALTHCARE
64200
163 | Breathing / Respiratory MEDSOUREE MICRO MIST NEBULIZERIICRO MIST |MSOMS-22883 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $0.990J0 AS SPECIFIED 0.680 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.7800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 0.8800 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.6800(
Nebulizer w/ tee, 7 ft tubing, mouthpiece &
164 | Alternate for Above TELEFLEX 411882 $ 0.86p0 MEDSTORM $0.6400( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDTECH $ 0.67040 RUSCH 1882 0.74000 EAW2024 $ .7500 O-BID 0.64004
30055 MTHMS22887
165 | Breathing / Respiratory WESTERNOXYGEN REGULATOR E CYLIND 0 - 25 |WSTMPR-804 AS SPECIFIED $ 76.630) AS SPECIFIED $77.530¢0 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 92.1300 ND:B NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 76.63004
MEDICA |LPM BARBED OUTLET
166 | Alternate for Above INOVO 2341-52501 $ 46.9500 MEDSTORM $36.3700! NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $  61.000] NO-BID MERET| $ 51.000q40 ALLIED| $ 107.2200p EAW2806 $ 51.9%00 NO-BID 36.37004
14288 010R25 MEDEMSREG87 HEALTHCARE
5 L270-220
167 | Breathing / Respiratory TELEFLEXHUDSON RCI-OVER-THE EAR TEL1103 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.37p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.33000 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.5400 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.4800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.35700 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.4200 NO-BI NO-BI 0.33009
MEDICAL |CAUNNULA W/CURVED NONFLARED
168 | Alternate for Above DYNAREX 14519 $ 0.31¢0 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.29040 NO-BID EAW2000$ 0.250 NO-BID 0.2500(
VEN1207,
169 | Breathing / Respiratory TELEFLEXHUDSON RCI-OVER-THE EAR TEL1104 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.36p0 AS SPECIFIED $0.33000 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.5400 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.7200 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 0.36do0 AS SPECIFIED $ 0.3600 AS $ 0.460p NO-BID 0.3300(9
MEDICAL |CAUNNULA W/CURVED FLARED NASAL SPECIFIED
170 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID medsource ms- $ 0.280) NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID VENTLAB| $ 0.2400 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 0.24009
24004 VEN1007,
171 |Breathing / Respiratory WESTERNOXYGEN REGULATOR COMPACT CLICK [WSTOPA-850 AS SPECIFIED $ 32.860 AS SPECIFIED $33.230¢0 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 60.4600 ND:B NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 32.8600(4
MEDICA |STYLEO-25LPM
172 | Alternate for Above NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE $  44.200] NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID EAW2806506  21.990 NO-BID 21.99004
MS-010R15
173 | Breathing / Respiratory WESTERNOXYGEN D CYLINDER ALUMINUM WSTPX-8702-1T AS SPECIFIED $ 55.440 AS SPECIFIED $56.100¢0 NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 57.4000 ND:B NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 55.44004
MEDICA |W/TOGGLE VALVE
174 | Alternate for Above MERET D4150 $ 42.40p0 MERET CAT-1 $41.6000 CRAMER| $ 38.560 NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOM¢ $  55.000 NO-BID MERET| $ 49.500q0 ALLIED| $  39.3300p EAW2813 $ 52.9%00 NO-BID 38.5600(
DECKER| MED-DT MEPK870MDT HEALTHCARE 31.
K8702DT| 10-2014
175 | Diagnostic Equipment AMERICANDIAGNOSTIX 2100 DIGITAL FINGERTIP |ADC2100 AS SPECIFIED $ 70.46p0 AS SPECIFIED $89.10000 AS SPEOIFIE 66.140 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 99.0p00 NO-BID AS SFHED| $ 63.000¢0 AS SPECIFIED$  43.8200 NO-BID NO-BID 43.8200(
DIAGNOSTIC|PULSE OXIMETER
176 |Alternate for Above BEIJING CHOICE $ 40.00g0 MEDSTORM $27.38000 MEDSOURCE $ 63.600} NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID EDI70000 $ 38.950f NO-BID 27.3800(
69100MS 69100 MS-740002
177 | Diagnostic Equipment MEDSOURGE ANEROID SPHYGMOMANOMETERiId |MSOMS-BP300 AS SPECIFIED $ 8.43p0 AS SPECIFIED $7.83000 AS SPEOIF$ 5.840 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 7.8800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 7.23040 NO-BID AS $ 6.990p NO-BID 5.8400(
Navy Latex Free SPECIFIED
178 | Alternate for Above ASIA| $ 5.0040 MEDSTOR| $4.6200( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDTECH $ 5.700d0 ADC 77S-105ANNH  $ 9.84000 NO-BID NO-BID 4.6200(4
CONNECTION 36011 MTH70003
179 | Diagnostic Equipment MEDSOURGE ANEROID SPHYGMOMANOMETE&ge |MSOMS-BP200 AS SPECIFIED $ 8.43p0 AS SPECIFIED $7.83000 AS SPEOIF$ 6.490 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 7.8800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 7.23040 NO-BID AS $ 7.990p NO-BID 6.4900(
Adult Navy Latex Free SPECIFIED
180 |Alternate for Above ASIA| $ 5.75(0 MEDSTOR| $5.8100 NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BIC NO-BID MEDTECH $ 5.7000pADC 775-12XNMM  $ 12.92040 NO-BID NO-BID 5.7000(
CONNECTION 36013 MTH70002
181 | Diagnostic Equipment MEDSOURGE ANEROID SPHYGMOMANOMETERIult |[MSOMS-BP100 AS SPECIFIED $ 7.69p0 AS SPECIFIED $6.84000 AS SPEOIF$ 5.840 NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 7.8800 NO-BID AS SPECIFIEB 6.91040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 5.8400(
Navy Latex Free
182 | Alternate for Above ASIA| $ 5.004o MEDSTOR| $4.7600( NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID MEDTECH $ 5.700q0 ADC 775-11ANMM  $ 9.84p00 EDI730100 $ 8508 NO-BID 4.76004
CONNECTION 36012 MTH70001
183 | Diagnostic Equipment CARE LINEDIGITAL THERMOMETER DISPOSABLE | CLN060-2210 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID AS SPECIFIED $ 3.850 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 3.8500(
INC
184 | Alternate for Above MEDIAID 2731- $ 2.187Jo BRIGGS 15600 $2.65p00 NO-BID NO-BID MEDSOURCE MSOMY $ 2.990 NO-BID ADC AME413B  $ 3.40p00 ADC 413MM 2.2500p EDI7449% 1.860 NO-BID 1.8600(
68115 121000
185 | Diagnostic Equipment CONMED| PadPro Defibrillator Pads &Reatislucent CMD2516M AS SPECIFIED $ 11.305) AS SPECIFIED $20.2400Q0 AS SPECIFIED $  30.4400 NO:BID AS SPECIFIB  25.500] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 20.04ooo ASGEPED| $ 32.58000 AS $ 18.710p NO-BID 11.3050(
Medtronic Cable-Adult 6in. x 4.25in. SPECIFIED
186 |Alternate for Above CONMED R29710 $ 7.555) NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID CONMED 3112- $ 15.90040 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID 7.5550(
1731
187 | Diagnostic Equipment CONMED| PadPro Defibrillator Pads &Reatislucent CMD2603M AS SPECIFIED $ 12.720 AS SPECIFIED $30.960Q0 AS SPECIFIED $ 13.94500 NO:BID AS SPECIFIB  25.500] NO-BID AS SPECIFIED 23.2¢000 ASGEPED| $ 30.03800 AS $ 18.710p NO-BID 12.7200(
Medtronic Cable-Pediatric 4.25in. x 2.875in. SPECIFIED
188 | Alternate for Above CONMED| $ 7.550 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID HEARTSYNG $ 16.6000) NO-BID NO-